
 

Date: 16th September 2020 

Our Reference: FOIA-2020-103 

 

RE: Your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

  

I write in response to your Freedom of Information Act 2000 (or ‘FoIA 2000’) request dated 31/08/2020 in 

which you requested: 

“When the COP conducted their scientific study and research for the national fitness standard of AFO's 
(Authorised Firearms Officers), what was the age groups of the following when it was researched? 

1. The minimum and maximum of ages of both male and female AFO's  UK (Authorised Firearms 
Officers) that took part in the study, and their age groups.i.e.18-24, 25-30 etc etc, all the way to 60+ 

2. Out of the total female and male  AFO's over the age of 50, how many failed to achieve the minimum 
of 7.6 in the Bleep Test, within your study? 

3. When the MDP (Ministry of Defence Police) , DPF (Defence Police Federation),and COP (College of 
Policing) and the late CC (Chief Constable) Alf Hitchcock and INM (Institute  of Naval Medicine) finally 
agreed and endorsed and accepted that the  JRFT ( Job Related Fitness Test) for MDP would be 5.7 in 
the MSFT (Multi Stage Fitness Test), can you supply that "LETTER" from COP to DPF and  the late CC 
MDP Sir Alf Hitchcock that endorsed and accepted that MDP JRFT for an AFO would be 5.7 in the Bleep 
Test, and if you cant why not? 

4. Are the COP (College of Policing) aware that the current retirement age of an officer serving within the 
MDP (Ministry of Defence Police) is 67 and not 60 compared with our Home Office and Scottish Office 
Police  Forces, and if the COP are not aware of the retirement age of an MDP officer, then what is it? 

5. Does the COP (College of Policing) recognise that it is a totally unacceptable, and inappropriate and 
an legitimate aim for an MDP AFO age 60+ and lower to achieve 7.6 in the MSFT.” 

 

Decision 

 

After conducting careful searches for any information relevant to your request I can confirm that there is 

some information held. We have dealt with each part of your request below: 

 

1. The minimum and maximum of ages of both male and female AFO's  UK (Authorised 
Firearms Officers) that took part in the study, and their age groups.i.e.18-24, 25-30 etc etc, 
all the way to 60+ 



No recorded information held. However, please find the link for the publicly available ‘Job Related 
Fitness Tests For Police Officer Specialist Posts’ report here. This report contains data relevant to part 1 
of your request. 

2. Out of the total female and male  AFO's over the age of 50, how many failed to achieve the 
minimum of 7.6 in the Bleep Test, within your study? 

No recorded information held. 

3. When the MDP (Ministry of Defence Police) , DPF (Defence Police Federation),and COP 
(College of Policing) and the late CC (Chief Constable) Alf Hitchcock and INM (Institute  of 
Naval Medicine) finally agreed and endorsed and accepted that the JRFT ( Job Related 
Fitness Test) for MDP would be 5.7 in the MSFT (Multi Stage Fitness Test), can you supply 
that "LETTER" from COP to DPF and  the late CC MDP Sir Alf Hitchcock that endorsed and 
accepted that MDP JRFT for an AFO would be 5.7 in the Bleep Test, and if you cant why 
not? 

No recorded information held. For context, the College has not ‘agreed, endorsed or accepted’ that the 
JRFT standard for MDP AFOs would be 5.7 on the MSFT. The MDP set the role requirement for their 
staff, not the College and consequently, we cannot provide information in line with this part of the 
request. 

4. Are the COP (College of Policing) aware that the current retirement age of an officer 
serving within the MDP (Ministry of Defence Police) is 67 and not 60 compared with our 
Home Office and Scottish Office Police  Forces, and if the COP are not aware of the 
retirement age of an MDP officer, then what is it? 

I can confirm there is information held for this part of the request. Please find attached, under the title 
of ‘Disclosure document 1’, two letters sent from the Civil Nuclear Police Federation to the College, 
regarding retirement age. 

To confirm, relevant employees at the College are aware of the retirement age. 

An exemption under section 40(2) – Personal information has been applied to both letters, allowing us to 
redact all identifiable information. Please find our reasoning for applying section 40(2) below. 

5. Does the COP (College of Policing) recognise that it is a totally unacceptable, and 
inappropriate and an legitimate aim for an MDP AFO age 60+ and lower to achieve 7.6 in 
the MSFT. 

No recorded information held. 

 

Yours sincerely, 

 

Kate Kaufman | Legal Researcher 

Information Management and Legal Team 

College of Policing 

Email:  FOI@college.pnn.police.uk 

Website: www.college.police.uk 

https://www.college.police.uk/What-we-do/Standards/Fitness/Documents/FWG_Report_final.pdf
mailto:FOI@college.pnn.police.uk
http://www.college.police.uk/


Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Personal Information 

 

Section 40(2) FoIA states:  

“Any information to which a request for information relates is also exempt information if-  

(a) It constitutes personal data which do not fall within subsection (1), and  

(b) Either the first or the second condition below is satisfied.”  

 

Essentially, under section 40(2) FoIA (by virtue of section 40(3A)), personal data of a third party can be 

withheld if any of the data protection principles would be breached by disclosing that data. Personal data 

is defined in section 3(2) of the Data Protection Act 2018 (DPA) as being:  

“Any information relating to an identified or identifiable living individual”.  

 

Section 3(3) DPA defines an identifiable living individual as:  

“a living individual who can be identified, directly or indirectly, in particular by reference to –  

(a) an identifier such as a name, an identification number, location data or an online identified, or  

(b) one or more factors specific to the physical, physiological, genetic, mental, economic, cultural or 

social identity of the individual”.  

 

Under section 40(2), redactions have been used in disclosure document 1 to prevent personal data from 

being released into the public domain. Names, telephone numbers, addresses, job titles etc. have all 

been redacted as they would otherwise lead to the direct identification of living individuals.  

 

The data protection principles are provided under Article 5 of the General Data Protection Regulations 

2018 (GDPR). Article 5(1)(a) states that personal data shall be: “processed lawfully, fairly and in a 

transparent manner in relation to the data subject”. We are committed to openness and transparency 

and recognise the wider public interest in full disclosure of College documents. However, we also have a 

legal duty to ensure that the rights to privacy of individuals are protected and we do not believe that it 

would be fair to disclose the requested information. We consider that the disclosure of the redacted 

information would not be fair, lawful or transparent and would therefore breach the first data protection 

principle under Article 5(1) (a) GDPR. 

  



Your right of review 

 

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 you have a right to request an internal review if you are 

dissatisfied with our handling of your request. Review requests should be made in writing (by email or 

post) within 40 working days from the date of our original response.  We will aim to respond to your review 

request within 20 working days. 

The Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) 

If, after lodging a review request you are still dissatisfied, you may raise the matter with the ICO. For further 

information you can visit their website at https://ico.org.uk/for-the-public/official-information/. Alternatively, 

you can contact them by phone or write to them at the following address:  

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Phone:  0303 123 1113 

 

https://ico.org.uk/for-the-public/official-information/
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